From: Bella Klein <|| N -
To: Lesley Groff <[ |

Subject: Re: Reimbursement for Lesley (Can Rich Bring Today?) $1910.44
Date: Tue, 30 May 2017 17:59:28 <0000

Attachments: Scan 174.pdf; Scan_175.pdf: Scan 176.pdf: Scan 177.pdf: Scan 178.pdf; Scan 179.pdf;
Scan_180.pdf; Scan_181.pdf: Scan_182.pdf: Scan_183.pdf; Scan 184.pdf; Scan 185.pdf;
Scan_186.pdf

ves, 1 gave it to his, sorry so busy..
Thank you,
Bella

Tel: 212-971-1307

On May 30, 2017, at 1:57 PM, Lesley Gmﬂ"ﬂ_?' wrote:

...can Rich bring today. ..l didn't hear back from you. .. ;)

Begin forwarded message:

From: Lesley Groff _}

Subject: Reimbursement for Lesley (Can Rich Bring Today?) $1910.44
Date: May 30, 2017 at 12:23:12 PM EDT

To: Bella Klein <} llEGEEE-

Hi Bella. Attached are my receipts for gifts and food...Could Rich please bring over with him today for
me?

Total: $1910.44

Gifts: $1847.49
Food: $62.95
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