From: Lesley Groff q~_f*
To: Sultan Bin Sulayem {_3
Ce: Bella Klein <[ | | N -
Subject: Re: Wiring instructions

Date: Tue, 13 Jun 2017 18:13:28 +0000

Great. Thank you

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 13, 2017, at 2:02 PM, Sultan Bin Sulayem &_'-* wrote:

Ok the amount is $6084.95

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 13, 2017, at 9:08 PM, Lesley Gruﬂ"ﬂ'_?' wrote:

Fantastic! So happy they have made it to you safe and sound! Bella in our accounting department will send
vou his wiring instructions. Take care. Lesley

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 13, 2017, at 1:00 PM, Sultan Bin Sulayem ﬂ_‘-* wrote:

Dear Leslhie
I have just received the test kits
Thank you so much

Please e mail me Jeffery wiring instructions so [ can send the money

Sent from my iPhone

EFTA00454000



