
From: Lesley Groff 
To: Philippe VAN DEN BROEK 

Subject: Re: Architectonik invoice 
Date: Thu, 08 Jun 2017 17:35:00 +0000 

HI Philippe...thank you for this! I will investigate... 

On Jun 8, 2017, at 1:10 PM, Philippe VAN DEN BROEK < 

Bonjour Lesley, 

Did you received my e-mail on May 15 regarding the flat fee ? 

Best regards 

Philippe VAN DEN BROEK 
archltectec 
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Debut du message reexpedie : 

De: Philippe VAN DEN BROEK • 
Objet: Architectonik Invoice 
Date: 15 mai 2017 12:12:39 UTC-4 
A: "Jeffrey E." leevacation@gmail.com> 
Cc: 

Bonjour Jeffrey, 

wrote: 

Regarding our last e-mail, I am working on the modification of the project... It will be not exactly the same 
as I have new idea regarding your comments. 

Coming soon new plans before to do any 3D. 

Please find attached my first invoice which is 10.000,00E corresponding to 50% of the total amount. 

Best regards. 
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Philippe VAN DEN BROEK 
arcHtectec 
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