
From: James I personal genius •c > 
To: Malvin Dela cruz 
Cc: Bella Kkin < IIIMM>, Richard Kahn Lesley Groff 

Subject: Re: 301 TV 
Date: Fri, 30 Jun 2017 11:53:46 4.0000 

Perfect. I'll meet him there, thanks. 

Thank you, 

Names Cc, your Personal Genius, 
http://personalgcnius.us 

On Jun 30, 2017, at 7:51 AM. Melvin Dela crux -Ma wrote: 

I will have him go straight there on Wednesday 
so around 9 am. 

Thanks 

Melvin Dela Cruz 

On Jun 30, 2017, at 7:44 AM, james I personal genius wrote: 

Just Leo & I. Ifs probably better if she's not there. 

Merwin - Anytime Wednesday or Thursday would be great. When can you spare Leo? 

Thank yoµ 

„lames Cc. your Personal Genius, 
http://pcisonalgenius.us 

On Jun 30, 2017, at 7:42 AM, Bella Klein allIMM> wrote: 

will be away July 1st - July 10th, Do you need=to be present or Leo can help while she is away? 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel 

On km 29, 2017, at 10:45 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

leo can get rid of 
Insley can you help us coordinate will 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 
tel 

eel 
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On Jun 29,2017, at 10:43 PM, jaws I personal genius wrote: 

Hi Rich, 

I'd discussed this with Merwin earlier. I need a second set of hands to install the TV itself, so we were going to ask Leo to help me. 

Menyin sap they're out Monday & Tuesday for the holiday. At the moment. lam available all day Wednesday. Thursday and Friday... I imagine we need to coordinate w with too. 

Is there anything special we need to do with the old Iv. or can Leo get rid of it? 

Palames Cc. your Personal Genius. 
http:llpersonalgenius.us 

On Jun 29, 2017, at 9:09 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

please let us know when you would like to install along with apple tv 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

tealce 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: 301 TV Invoice paid by RK 
Date: June 28. 2017 at 11:46:24 AM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn ICE < IMali• 

<S3 

Details for Order #112-0123773-0953860 
Print this page for your records. 

Order Placed: June 27, 2017 
Amazon.com order number: 112.0123773.0953860 
Order Total: $487.76 

Preparing for Shipment 

Items Ordered 
1 of: Sony KDL48W6SOD 48-inch 1080p Smart LED TV (2016 Model) 
SCE by: Arr6.120n.COT LLC 

Cynclibon, new 

Shipping Speed: 
Two-Day Shipping 

tat 

Price 
$448.00 

dress: Itern(s) Subtotal: $448.00 
Shipping & Handling: $0.00 

Total before tax: $448.00 
Sales Tax: $39.76 

Total for This Shipment:$487.76 

Payment information 
Payment Method: 
Amazon.com Store Card I Last digits: 

Itern(s) Subtotal: $448.00 
Shipping & Handling: $0.00 

Billing address 

EFTA00454731



RICHARD KAHN 

Credit Card transactions 

Total before tax: $448.00 
Estimated tax to be collected: S39.76 

Grand Total:$487.76 

AMaZ011..C.203 Store Card ending in =June 27, 2017:$0.00 

To view the status of your order, return to Order ry. 
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