
From: Bella Klein 

To: "Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)"
Cc: Lesley Groff <I 

Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for (plus other documents) 
Date: Wed, 21 Jun 2017 13:08:50 +0000 

Attachments: doc09301920170621114452.pdf 

Great, 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Jun 21, 2017, at 7:47 AM, Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek) < > wrote: 

Dear Bella, 
Payment received. 
At the attachment you will find the slip. 

Best Regards 

Rixos Premium Belek 

Bit Ceylan 
Reservation Manager 
Mobile : 

IIr 

Belek Mahalleal Kongre Caddeel No:181A 
Belek /Serlk Antalya Turkey 

Phone : 

Fax: 

LIMULtilittalKelafe 

From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 4:54 PM 
To: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek) 
Cc: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for (plus other documents) 

mailto: 

Appreciate very much, Please try about our afternoon time for money to be posted to the account 
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Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Jun 20, 2017, at 9:49 AM, Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek) < > wrote: 

ok I will try tomorrow 
thanks 

Rixos Premium Belek 
Elif Ceylan 
Reservation Manager 

Mobile : 

Belek Manalleal Kongre Geddes, No. IBA 
Belek /Sank Antalya Turkey 

Phone : 

Fax: 

Illjeilwenv n KOS COM 

From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 4:39 PM 
To: Lesley Groff 
Cc: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek) 
Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for (plus other documents) 

mailto: 

It happened that we reached our credit limit. I just prepaid card and it will be available tomorrow for use, Please let me know 
if it works for you to process charge tomorrow again.. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Jun 20, 2017, at 9:20 AM, Lesley Groff <-- wrote: 

Oh my. Ok. I will have Bella in our accounting dept look into this. I am not 
sure what is wrong. Thank you for letting me know. We will get to the 
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bottom of this. Appreciate your help. Lesley 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 20, 2017, at 9:09 AM, Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek) 
> wrote: 

Dear 
No payment is received from the card. Not accepted. 

Best Regards 

Rixos Premium Belek 
Elif Coylan 

Reservation Manager 
Mobile : 

VJ 

IId 

Bair 1.4ahaileal Kongre Caddeel No:18/A 
Belek /Sera( Antalya Turkey 

Phcoe : 

Fax: 

heplAwv.rixos.com 

From: Lesley Groff a 
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 3:39 PM 
To: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek) 
Cc: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for (plus other documents) 

On Jun 20, 2017, at 8:33 AM, Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)   - v rote: 

Dear Lesley, 

Please write total amount to form. 

Best Regards 
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Rixos Premium Belek 

Eli? Ceylan 

Reservation Manager 

Mobile : 

IIr 

IIr 

From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 3:30 PM 
To: Sebia Soydan (Rixos Hotels - CHQ); Eli? Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek) 
Cc Bella Klein 
Subject: CC Authorization form for MI (plus other documents) 

mailto: 

Belek Mahal's& Kcagre Caddell No:18/A 
Bak Mak Antalya Turkey 

Phone : 

Fax: 

hap://vnarixos.com 
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