
From: 

To: "Sebla Soydan (Rixos Hotels - CHQ)" 

Cc: "Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)" 

Subject: Re: IME and 

Date: Sat, 17 Jun 2017 16:30:21 +0000 

Confirmation Letter 

Hello Selba and Elif. Thank you for this confirmation. I will provide a Visa card of Jeffreys soon. Probably tomorrow. It will 
be prior to the girls arrival for sure! Very grateful for all your help. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 17, 2017, at 7:08 AM, Sebla Soydan (Rixos Hotels - CHQ)  wrote: 

Dear I= 

Enclosed you'll find the confirmation letter for and room booking at the Rixos Premium Belek Hotel in Antalya. 

The boarding is on all inclusive system, meaning that almost every food and beverage consumption is included in the rate. There are 
always extra service with payment such as laundry, spa, hairdressers, some a la carte restaurants and premium quality alcoholic 
beverages etc. 

My colleague Ms. Elif Ceylan who is copied to this mail is in charge of the reservation department and I was told that American 
express is the only credit card we cannot accept the remote payment with. 

However, she'll send you a link where the cardholder logs in and makes the payment unless you'd like to provide Elif with another 
credit card such as master or visa. 

In regards with payment I kindly ask you please to liaise directly with Elif. 

Room and airport pick up is confirmed and as of morning of the 21st of June also the training at the Spa of The Land of Legends. 

Thank you. 

BRgds 

SEBLA 

Rixos Headquarters Istanbul Kongre Merkezi - oarulbedai Cad. No:3 Marblye / Sisli Istanbul Turkey 

EFTA00455183



Soda Soydan BORA 

Director of Chairman's Office /PA to Chairman Mr.Fettah Tamince 

Phone 

GJ G'4 

ligadtteamdsossora 

This communication contains information from Roos Hotel Company that may be confdential Except for personal use by the amended recaent. or as expressly authorized by the 
sender. any person who receives this information is prohibited from disclosing, copying. distributing, and/or using it If you have received this communication in error. please 
immediately delete a and all copies. and promptly notify the sender. Nothing in this communication 6 intended to operate as an electrcnbc signature under applicable law. 

<Confirmation xis> 

EFTA00455184


