
From• 
To: Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: fekkai 
Date Mon, 14 Aug 2017 21:11:38 +0000 

Hmmm. Very odd for me. Sounds like someone else is on that bill. makes her own appts 
I think. I'll call them. 

Sent from my iPhone 

> on Aug 14, 2017, at 4:49 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> • Hi -
> Please help out with Fe ' have invoice for you for $663.58 but charged to Amex 
1029.33. Also, charge for on August 3rd for $912.29 with out backup invoice. 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 
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