
From: Bella Klein
To: Lesley Groff 

Subject: Re: Amex travel - personal 
Date: Tue, 15 Aug 2017 17:55:32 +0000 

ok 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Aug 15, 2017, at 1:54 PM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 

ok super...I can bring the check for $150 to NY tomorrow...and give to Rich when he comes to see JE...he is 
scheduled to come see JE Thursday... 

Thanks! 

On Aug 15, 2017, at 1:51 PM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

ok, doesn't really matter too much one or two checks. I will wait and deposit together or send one replacement 
check... 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Aug 15, 2017, at 1:48 PM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 

Hi Bella... 
the $150 is a good charge. It is the fee for a minor traveling alone. I have a check here on my desk to 
Jeffrey under a pile of all my other stuff...sorry, I thought I had sent it. May I just send the $150 and you go 
ahead and you keep the check I already sent you for the $547? or must I write a new check for the $697? 

On Aug 15, 2017, at 1:40 PM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

Hi Les, 
Below please find additional charges for your travel. If $150 is a good charge, your check reimbursement 
does not cover the entire balance. Please let me know if you will send me a new check in the amount of 
$697 or credit will be issued. 

Thank you, 

EFTA00456446



Bella 

Tel: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: Au ust 15, 2017 at 1:36:23 PM EDT 
To: 

CS 3051ci 
[00:17:c8:25:f3:53] 

<doe02186120170815123620.Of> 
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