
From: "Natalia Molotkova"  

To: ' 

Subject: Aeroflot refund 

Date: Mon, 11 Sep 2017 15:13:10 +0000 

!,,CUS Centurion Banner 

And that is a great thing!!!! 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

super...thanks 
it was crazy over the weekend with more changes! U happy the last one of them is leaving Paris today! ;) 

On Sep 11, 2017, at 9:51 AM, Natalia Molotkova < wrote: 

MI I placed 60 000 American Express points to Mr. Epstein's account, like I promised. 

Finally, Aeroflot opened the ticket (the one we had for Dada in business and changed to coach). So, I requested 
refund of $1384.10, minus change fee 70.00EUR (84.00OSD), once refund processed, will get back cancellation 
fee of $84.00. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Privacy Statement I Visit the Centurion Card website 
To learn more about e-mail security or report a suspicious e-mail. please visit us at 
O 2015 American Express. All rights reserved 
American Express uses 3rd party concierge service providers who are not authorized to act on behalf of American Express and you acknowledge 
that American Express is in no way responsible or liable for the actions of the service provider and the only remedy for any claims relating to 
services or products provided by the service provider is against the service provider and not against American Express. You are responsible for 
any purchases, shipping charges and/or fees you authorize. We reserve the right to note profile and preference data for servicing purposes. 

America 
n 

Express ® 

EFTA00458156


