
From: Lesley Groff <MIMIII > 
To: Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: Prescriptions from Goldberger's Pharmacy 
Date: Mon, 18 Sep 2017 16:26:43 +0000 

yes, they do. One prescription was covered and is $10. the other was not covered and was 
$59. total $69.95 

> On Sep 18, 2017, at 12:24 PM, Bella Klein <  wrote: 

> • Les, 
> Does the pharmacy has JE insurance 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 

> • Tel: 

>> On Sep 18, 2017, at 12:20 PM, Lesley Groff .tz > wrote: 
>> 
>> I have paid for Your 2 prescriptions Dr. Josephson would like you to have. Goldberger's 
Pharmacy will deliver today. 
>> 
>> Merwin, please be on the lookout for deliver. thanks! 
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