From: Richard Kahn _}
To: Lesley Groff a_“?
Subject: Re: Peggy Siegal
Date: Mon, 13 Nov 2017 20:35:27 +0000

did jee respond?
if not i will try next. ..
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

On Nov 9, 2017, at 1:50 PM, Lesley Gmﬁ‘{—* wrote:

Hi Lesley!

Peggy wanted me to check in as she would like to know how Jeffrey would like to handle the last portion of her $30k
birthday gift.

She has a few more apartment renovation bills and was wondering how Jeffrey would like to handle...perhaps through
wire transfer? If so, her accountant can send the bank details.

Let me know what you guys think!
Best,

Rebecca Drescher
Assistant to Peggy Siegal

EFTA00463090



