From: Bella Klein <|| N -
To: Lesley Groff <||

Subject: Re: Reimbursement for Lesley-Can you Give to Rich to bring over at 11:30am today?
Date: Tue, 09 Jan 2018 15:32:40 +0000

Attachments: Scan 310.pdf; Scan 311.pdf; Scan 312.pdf; Scan 313.pdf; Scan_314.pdf; Scan 315.pdf;
Scan_316.pdf; Scan_317.pdf

Les,

Math doesnt work, 1 have only 481.95, please let me know
Thank you,

Bella

On Jan 9, 2018, at 10:06 AM, Lesley Gmle_‘-* wrote:

Hi Bella. Attached are my reimbursements. . _can you give to Rich as he has an appointment with JE today at

11:30am...

Total- $633.40

EFTA00467149



