
From: Lesley Groff
To: "Bernard Dr. Kruger"

Subject: Re: Invoice 
Date: Thu, 11 Jan 2018 18:20:23 +0000 

Thank you on Dr. Schmerin I will call and let them know Dr. Kruger recommended him 

Bella's phone number is 

are on there way to your office and should be there sho 

On Jan 11, 2018, at 1:18 PM, Bernard Kruger < 

Hi Lesley! 

We recommend Dr. Schmerin 

wrote: 

Can you also provide me with your accountant's phone number? I need to ask her one more 
question. 

Thank you! 

Haley 

On Thu, Jan 11, 2018 at 12:28 PM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
Jeffrey needs to send over 2 assistants who re uire some immediate attention to Dr. Kruger now...OK to 
send them to his office now at !? 

On Jan 11, 2018, at 12:25 PM, Bernard Kruger < > wrote: 

Thank you kindly! 

On Thu, Jan 11, 2018 at 12:22 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 
Received and will have accounting pay asap! 

> On Jan 11, 2018, at 12:11 PM, Bernard Kruger < wrote: 

> Good afternoon! 

> Per our phone conversation, please see the attached contract renewal and the invoice for his visit today. 
The services provided today are not included with the concierge. I am happy to answer any and all 
questions! 

> Haley 

> 
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