
From: Bella Klein <I 
To: Lesley Groff  

Subject: Re: Your payment to St Giles International London Central has been sent 
Date: Mon, 05 Feb 2018 15:33:59 +0000 

Attachments: ZM WFV St Giles 1268.40_122717.pdf 

The attached is what i paid, was it paid twice? 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Feb 5, 2018, at 10:17 AM, Lesley Groff< wrote: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: e: our payment to St Giles International London Central has been sent 
Date: January 4, 2018 at 1:31:05 PM EST 
To: Lesley Groff < 

Hello! Oh yes thank you so much, I confirmed it t: 

cp, 3 MM. 2018 r. e 11:46, Lesley Groff < >: 
HI ..wanted you to see St. Giles will receive your tuition payment soon!!.. 
Thanks, 
Lesley 
Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Flywire Support" < 
Subject: Your payment to St Giles International London Central has been sent 
Date: January 3, 2018 at 6:32:34 AM EST 
To: 

Your payment LNC633888439 for 918.00 GBP has been sent to St Giles International London Central. It may 
take a few days for the institution to update their account. 

EFTA00468899



Thanks for choosing Flywire. We look forward to helping you in the future! 

Best Regards, 

Flywire Support 

E-Mail: 
Customers Hotlines: 

US Toll Free 
US local number: 

141 Tremont Street 10th Floor Boston MA 02111 (USA) 
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