
From: Bella Klein
To: Lesley Groff 

Subject: Re: Invoice and flight info I was requested to pay for 
Date: Mon, 05 Feb 2018 16:05:12 +0000 

Inline-Images: IMG_7343.jpeg; IMG_7344.jpeg; IMG_7345.jpeg 

Ok, no worries, i just called school and requested credit for double payment. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel 

On Feb 5, 2018, at 10:49 AM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: ecem r  , a 8:31:48 AM EST 
To: Lesley Groff < 

Hello Lesley! I put a flight information, passport and also information about school! 
Thank you so much! 
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