
From: "Natalia Molotkova"

To: ' 

Subject: Can you check on &Ma's ticket...(Rec. Loc#ANATKQ) 

Date: Tue, 13 Feb 2018 21:54:53 +0000 

,,,2,US Centurion Banner 

Ticketing rejected it, said new fare has to be equal or higher (it was couple dollars lower) . So I have to go to next 
fare, higher, with change fee I am getting $878.80 add collect. 

I can issued just one way ticket at 259.81USD. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

thanks 

On Feb 13, 2018, at 4:32 PM, Natalia Molotkova < wrote: 

They exchanging it as we speak. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

thank you! 

On Feb 13, 2018, at 4:14 PM, Natalia Molotkova < wrote: 

EFTA00469380



Let me call ticketing, rush it. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

I still do not have Arina's ticket....it is getting late in Moscow ...can you check for me? 

(Rec. LocSANATKQ) 
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