From: Lesley Groff _

To: Jefffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail .com=>
Suhjun:l:- Dental Charge March 8
Date: Thu, 15 Mar 2018 18:40:33 +0000
Attachments: Amex Black Thomas Magnam - 031518 2860.pdf

Begin forwarded message:

From: Bella Kleinm
Subject: Re: $2400 charge at Dentist’? Jeffrey is asking...

Date: March 15, 2018 at 2:39:14 PM EDT
To: Lesley Groff

- on March 8

Thank vou,
Bella

Tel:

EFTA00470668



