
From: Lesley Groff 
To: Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: $2400 charge at Dentist? Jeffrey is asking... 
Date: Thu, 15 Mar 2018 18:57:56 +0000 

got it_.i sent him both.. 

> On Mar 15, 2018, at 2:54 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> • if the Amex, it would be his charge as is not posted yet 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 

> • Tel: 

>> On Mar 15, 2018, at 2:53 PM, Lesley Groff S>  wrote: 
>> 
>> I would think the Amex site, but I don't know for sure.. 
>> 
>>> On Mar 15, 2018, at 2:51 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 
>>> 
>>> Magnani site or Amex? 
>>> Thank you, 
>>> Bella 
>>> 
>>> 
>>> Tel: 
>>> 
>>> 
>>>> On Mar 15, 2018, at 2:50 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 
>>>> 
>>>> he can look on line at his charges I am sure! 
>>>> 
>>>>> On Mar 15, 2018, at 2:41 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 
>>>>> 
>>>>> Wondering how did he knew it I just now received bill? 
>>>>> Thank you, 
>>>>> Bella 
>>>>> 
>>>>> 
>>>>> Tel: 
>>>>> 
>>>>> 
>>>>>> On Mar 15, 2018, at 2:40 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 
>>>>>> 
>>>>>> thanks 
>>>>>> 
>>>>>>> On Mar 15, 2018, at 2:39 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>> on March 8 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>> <Amex_Black_Thomas MagnaniiIIIIIII031518 2860.pdf> 
>>>>>>> Thank you, 
>>>>>>> Bella 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>> Tel: 
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>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>>> On Mar 15, 2018, at 2:34 PM, Lesley Groff • > wrote: 
>>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>>> Jeffrey is asking who the $2400 charge at the dentist was for...? 
>>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>>> (Is that Jeffrey's xrays? on Feb. 13?!) 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>>> 
>>>>> 
>>>> 
>>> 
>> 
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