
From: Bella Klein 

To: 

Subject: Fwd: Barcelona 

Date: Mon, 19 Mar 2018 13:03:39 +0000 

•, do we have JE permission for W hotel 
Thank you, 

Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: March 19, 2018 at 7:37:45 AM EDT 
To: 
Cc: Bella Klein .4 
Subject: Re: Barcelona 

MO, we supposedly PRE Paid ! Make sure the hotel credits Jeffreys Amex card Tell the front desk person. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 19, 2018, at 7:33 AM, wrote: 

Hey , how are you ? They need to see the card physically so they gonna refund in the card and i II pay 
with mine . 111 send the invoice to Bella . Thanks 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 18 mars 2018 i3 04:35, 

Yes!!! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 17, 2018, at 6:24 PM, 

> a ecrit : 

> wrote: 
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Thank you The hotel is already paid ? 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 17 mars 2018 1 22:46, > a ecrit : 

prepaying for the room at the W Hotel!! (we cannot cancel when prepaying!) You will need your credit 
card for incidentals...Ticket and hotel stay will come to you shortly...I could not get you seats (they are 
under airport control) When you check in to your flights you can grab your seats! Hope you have fun... 

Rec. 

On Mar 17, 2018, at 5:12 PM, 

Departure Monday morning if it's possible 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 17 mars 2018 1 21:31, 

> wrote: 

> a ecrit : 

Hi ! Doing well. Hope you are too. I'll work on this for you! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 17, 2018, at 3:13 PM, > wrote: 

Hey , how are you ? Can you organise for me a ticket and an hotel in Barcelona . I would like 
to stay in W hotel if it's possible From tomorrow night Sunday until Wednesday 2Ith of March 
return to Paris . Thank you 
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Envoye de mon iPhone 
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