From: Bella Klein <|| | D
To: Lesley Groff <[

Ce: Merwin Dela cruz < . | <o Loking <[ H -

Subject: Re: Need Cash on Thursday to pay for Flowers
Date: Tue, 08 May 2018 20:27:43 0000
Attachments: Scan 348 pdf

I just paid with Amex 51097.862 as 5100 deposit was left with the order.

Thank you,
Bella

> on May B, 2018, at 4:15 PM, Lesley Groff <.'_;~ Wrote:

> Hi Bella.we have a deliwvery of flowers coming to the
will need cash here to pay for the inveice upon deliwvery.

house on Thursday by noon.
Can I =end Lec
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