
From: Good Tastes of Tuscany <info®tuscany-cooking-class.com> 

To: Lesley Groff < >, 
Subject: Re: Private Car for and Elina May 26 and June 2 

Date: Thu, 14 Jun 2018 09:06:37 +0000 
Attachments: mime_part_liapplicationlynd.openxmlformats-

officedocument.wordprocessingml.document) 

Hi Lesley, 

Here is the invoice enclosed for the payment. 

Warm Regards, 
Sharmila. 

The team at Goodtastesoftuscany 
Accademia Italiana di Cucina Pandolfini- professional culinary school and Villa Pandolfini Estate 
A memorable Tuscan culinary experience for food lovers and professionals 
http://www.tuscany-cooking-class.com 

On 8 June 2018 at 23:41, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
Can you please send an invoice to our accounting department like you did last time we needed to pay you with 
Pay Pal at below address?: 

On Jun 8, 2018, at 1:10 PM, Good Tastes of Tuscany <info@tuscany-cooking-class.com> wrote: 

yes total 80 euro 40 each transfer 

The team at Goodtastesoftuscany 
Accademia Italiana di Cucina Pandolfini- professional culinary school and Villa Pandolfini Estate 
A memorable Tuscan culinary experience for food lovers and professionals 
http://www.tuscany-cooking-class.com 

On 8 June 2018 at 19:04, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
Hello Sharmila...we can certainly take care of payment...I just want to make sure, the total balance is $80 
(not $160) correct? 

On Jun 8, 2018, at 12:51 PM, Good Tastes of Tuscany <info@tuscany-cooking-class.com> wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 

I hope the girls had a lovely time at the program. Just a quick mail to let you know that they need to pay 
a driver fee of 80 euro total both of them. They did not pay the driver so just pick up and drop-off is charged others 

EFTA00476608



not . 

They can make the payment direct from the below link - 

http://www.tuscany-cooking-class.congpay-online

Warm Regards, 
Sharmila. 

The team at Goodtastesoftuscany 
Accademia Italiana di Cucina Pandolfini- professional culinary school and Villa Pandolfini Estate 
A memorable Tuscan culinary experience for food lovers and professionals 
http://www.tuscany-cooking-class.com 

On 22 May 2018 at 22:30, Lesley Groff wrote: 
you have been incredibly helpful!!! I greatly appreciate all! (just fyi-both girls do speak english ;) 

On May 22, 2018, at 12:57 PM, Good Tastes of Tuscany <info@tuscany-cooking-class.com> wrote: 

thank you , not to be difficult but sometimes they do not speak english 

The team at Goodtastesoftuscany 
Accademia Italiana di Cucina Pandolfini- professional culinary school and Villa Pandolfini Estate 
A memorable Tuscan culinary experience for food lovers and professionals 
http://www.tuscany-cooking-class.com 

On 22 Ma 2018 at 18:32, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
I have on this response mail...she will keep Meaghan's cell! thank you 

On May 22, 2018, at 12:20 PM, Good Tastes of Tuscany <info@tuscany-cooking-class.com>
wrote: 

Please give her Mea han's number all drivers are contacted through her to avoid communication 
problems 

The team at Goodtastesoftuscany 
Accademia Italiana di Cucina Pandolfini- professional culinary school and Villa Pandolfini Estate 
A memorable Tuscan culinary experience for food lovers and professionals 
http://www.tuscanycooking-class.com 

On 22 May 2018 at 16:07, Lesleaiff < > wrote: 
lease  have Meaghan contact directly on May 25th with the pertinent information. 

is cc'd here and you have her cell. thank you for your help. 

EFTA00476609



On May 22, 2018, at 10:03 AM, Good Tastes of Tuscany <info@tuscany-cooking-class.com>
wrote: 

HI Lesley, 

Yes we can arrange for the transfer from Firenze to the estate and back into Florence , the 
contact will always be Meaghan and then she knows which driver will be assigned the service 
and can call them as the company has many different drivers and do not assign until last 
minute , day prior 

The team at Goodtastesoftuscany 
Accademia Italiana di Cucina Pandolfini- professional culinary school and Villa Pandolfini 
Estate 
A memorable Tuscan culinary experience for food lovers and professionals 
http://www.tuscany-cooking-class.com 

On 22 May 2018 at 12:53, wrote: 
Good mornin ! Can ou lease confirm the reservation of a private car to pick up 

and on May 26th at 4pm from the below address in Florence. 

Via Giovanni Prati 21, Florence, Toscana 50124, Italy 

They will also need a private car on June 2 at 11 am to take them back to Florence. They 
need to be driven to Budget Car rental. Address below: 

FIrc02 Firenze, Via Borgo Ognissanti 128 Firenze 50123 FIrc02 

Cell number forte 

They can pay in Cash. 

Please confirm back receipt of this request along with the name, phone number and 
confirmation # of the car service for them. 

Thank you, 
Lesley 

EFTA00476610


