
From: "Natalia Molotkova" < 

To: ' 'c 
Subject: Flight for Karyna 

Date: Thu, 21 Jun 2018 15:59:40 +0000 

L,,1.1S Centurion Banner 

My pleasure!! 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

thanks! 

On Jun 21, 2018, at 11:51 AM, Natalia Molotkova < > wrote: 

Done, used points, $577.40 will be credited back to account. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Great! please use points. the CID # is 9049 

On Jun 21, 2018, at 11:46 AM, Natalia Molotkova > wrote: 

Yes, will be 57 740 points and 20 % back, points are nonreversible. Will need CID. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

EFTA00476971



Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

ok, thanks for checking re credit. 
Please issue below ticket for Karyna...can we use points and receive the percentage back like we have done?. 

On Jun 21, 2018, at 11:20 AM, Natalia Molotkova > wrote: 

Ticket 0067147247210 was already exchanged (credit used). 

I don't have any other Delta credit for her. 

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to change. 
• Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $577.40. 
• Ticket is non-refundable, $200.00 change penalty applies plus difference in fare 
• Mon 25 Jun - Delta 461 - First - 4h 9m 
Departing: New York John F Kennedy Airport, (JFK) at 8.35am 
Arriving: Cyril E. King Airport, St. Thomas (STT) at 12.44pm 

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

yes. can you use the outstanding credit and we pay the difference? 

On Jun 21, 2018, at 11:10AM, Natalia Molotkova > wrote: 

I am getting fare in business $577.40, still OK? 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

EFTA00476972



(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

On it. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Please book below flight for Karyna for Monday June 25th...what is first class price/biz...do we have any 
outstanding credits on Delta for Karyna? (I show we have a credit of $428.20 alid until May 8th, 2019. Change fee 
is $200. Rec. Loc#CGTOYO Delta Rec. Loc# JMUTHA. TICKET NUMBER 0067147247210) 

Jeffrey would like me to fly to the island on Monday June 25th. Could you please book this flight for me? 

Thanks a lot! 

Karyna 
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