
From: =ISS 
To: •0=~1~ ,-

Subject: Re: World Cup/Sisterffi 
Date: Thu, 28 Jun 2018 17:18:37 +0000 

ok. let me try to purchase this neket for your sisten! 

On Jun 28, 2018, at 1:14 PM,_-‘:: "rot; 

Perfect for this one 

Envoye de mon iPhonc 

Le 28 juin 2018 å 18:14.ffillffi -a Cent • 

I just found this: 

Jul 1, 2018 

<U6_sq.svg> 

Ural Airlines 

12:O5am 
KZN 

From Kazan Inta. (KZN) 
To Domodedovo ente. (DME) 

1:40am 
DME 

1h 35m, Nonstopon Jun 28, 2018, at 11:01 AM, MI= ffi l> wrotc: 

There is no eady flight ? 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 2(1 juin 2018 å 16:41.__.. a aret: 

can 1 book this later flight 'Ur your sister ? Departing 5pm arriving 6:30pm? it's all i can tind! i n ant to push 'send' lo purchase bue waiting to hear from 
you! 

On Jun 28,2018, at 10:33 AM, 

1 would love bot 1 can't use my credit card 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 28 juin 2018 å 16:12, a ecrit : 

Can you book this fight!? We can't End it!...can you grab it and pay on your CC then we will have Bella svire you the funds... 

On Jun 28, 20 18, ati NTC<C: 

<image I.jpeg> 

Envoyé dc mon iPhonc 

Le njuin 2018 å 15:5" ffi <fl› a krit: 

I will book this flight for her...hclp me frid a fight from Kanin to Moscow for her!! 

On Jun 28, 2018, at 9:46 Am, ffi lliffi Ø wrote: 

Sure you can do this onc . I II wait for her at the airport 

Envoye dc mon iPhonc 

Lc 28 juin 2018 å 15:42,==c: a &rit : 

can we do Belavia Air??!! 

Your Flight Information 
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Outbound 

Departure Arrival Flight Duration Fare 

29.06201811:15 29.06.2018 15:15 B2 866 3h00m 
Paris, Charles De Gaulle(CDG) Minsk(MSQ) Operated: Belavia Ernbraer 195 Economy Flexible (Y) 

Connection time: 8h35m 

29.062018 23:50 30.06.2018 02:10 B2 937 2h20m 
Minsk(MSQ) Kazan(KZN) Operated: Belavia Boeing 737-800 Economy Flexible (Y) 

Fares 

Fare Taxes Passengers Total 

309.00 EUR 86.50 EUR 1 Adult 395.50 EUR 

Total: 395.50 EUR 

On Jun 28, 2018, at 9:27 AM, 4:IM=II I> wrote: 

Thank you m so happy 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 28 juin 2018 a 15:23,__ a &tit : 

Jeffrey Gave me permission to purchase your sisters tickets!!! Calling my agent now!! 

On Jun 28, 2018, at 8:42 AM, MEM c:MMEla wrote: 

As soon as you know , let me know . Thank you MI 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Lc 28 juin 2018 a 14:00, ==c:MINII > a &fit : 

Hmmmm. I don't either. 
Well, let's see what today holds. He has appointments out of the house this morning ... 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 2s, 2018, at 7:57 AM, EN= •cM=I > wrote:

And he said it's not a question of money . So I don't understand 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 28 juin 2018 a 13:48, ==<MIIIMI =a ecrit : 

Ok 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 28, 2018, at 7:46 Am, == 

I talk to him and he said that you II check . 

Envoye dc mon iPhone 

Lc 28 juin 20 a a 13:43, ==•;: > a &sit : 

I will check on this Flight today. Let's see if it helps. Did you speak to Jeffrey on any of this?... maybe that would help? Or you did already ... 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 27, 2018, at 5:44 PM, wrote: 
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I found another one from Moscou to Paris 
<image [pits> 

Envoy& dc mon iPhonc 

Le 27 juin 2018 23:40, =I= c:MIMIII > a emit : 

I had her on the same flight as you from paris to Kazan. There were only 2 scats left and they are in biz class. So that hurts the entire 
ticket(51600). The one to Moscow you gave me was sold out. I found one for $415.50. Not bad. The trip fmm Moscow to Paris was the one 
you found and it was over $1000 also. Each ticket had to be purchase separately because they were different airlines... 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Jun 27, 2018. at 5:34 PM, M.= <a wrote: 

Ticket that I found for the whole trip was the half of this price . But I understand 

Envoye de mon iPhonc 

Le 27 juin 2018 1 23:27,MMca. a ecrit : 

Such a shame. Maybe you can talk to Jeffrey? I don't know. The 3 tickets I cad out for your sister were about $3400. Flights and 
availability are super slim. Almost gone. Jeffrey did say ok to asking one of n.  friends to go with you. Maybe a cute boy 

I'm sorry. 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Jun 27, 2018, at 5:05 PM, MEM c:IM=II I> wrote: 

I II try to ask her to get her ticket . I told her it was ok and she cancelled a meeting on Friday for that .... I don't want to go with 
someone that I don't know . Thank you 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 27 juin 2018 a 22:41, a acrit : 

understand... 
maybe IMMI has a friend you could go with? She grew up in Kazan. I did not realize the extra ticket was for someone you were 
hoping to go with you...i can't get our money back . it is done. 

On Jun 27, 2018, at 4:37 PM, MI= ala> wrote: 

1 didn't wanted to go alone ... 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 27 juin 2018 a 22:19, MI c:MMINI > a oCrit : 

Hi _...Jeffrey says unfortunatley your sister cannot attend this time on your trip...) am purchasing a ticket to meet you 
in Moscow on July 1. I will send you her details. 

Why did you request 2 tickets to the France vs Argentina game June 30th? I purchased 2 as you requested and am hoping 
someone is going with you?!...was one for your sister? ...and now she is not going') 

Jeffrey says to find an Airbnb for your stay in Kazan June 29-July I ... 
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