
From: 

To: Lesley Groff 

Subject: Re: Hotel , flight tickets :) 

Date: Sat, 21 Jul 2018 22:29:23 +0000 

Attachments: 6154B90D-1F87-451B-8FBB-1E5A87974CC8jpeg; C596C033-65B7-49B8-B1FD-
A59F952AF786.png 

They will charge me 348$ 
Receipts are attached 

On Saturday, July 21, 2018, 5:28:03 PM EDT, Lesley Groff wrote: 

I am told you must pay at the time you make the reservation. Send the reservation receipt to me and I'll send to Bella. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 21, 2018, at 5:23 PM, < > wrote: 

Ok , understood . 
Thank you 

On Saturday, July 21, 2018, 4:30:37 PM EDT, Lesley Groff wrote: 

M, the hotel needs to be booked on line and paid for. Is it possible for you to book for yourself and get reimbursed? Bella 
can wire the money to your account I'd think. The reservation needs to be made with your cc and under your name 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 21, 2018, at 10:13 AM, cr > wrote: 

Hello Lesley , 
I'm so sorry for bothering you at the weekend time , but have to ask you for a little help. 
Spoke yesterday to JE via email . 
He gave me approval . 
I'm going to Finland to 
And 
For the embassy appt . I must have the flight tickets reservation (not to buy them yet ), my appt on wed 
August 1st. 

it's finnair , direct flight from jfk to Helsinki and back to jfk 
From jfk on sun sept 2nd - At 5:40pm arriving to Helsinki on Monday 3rd at 8:50am 

till mon sept 10th from Helsinki Vantaa 
At 2:10pm arriving to jfk 3:50pm Monday . 

1 thing is rsvp for the tickets must be under my last name as I'm going to use the Russian passport 
to fly there . 

And 2nd thing is which I'm most worried about it's to book the hotel in Hamina (Finland ) . I checked almost 
all of them are sold out and honestly where I'm going to it's tiny town w / only 3 hotels out 
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there . So maybe you can book for me the hotel because it's says now that the last room available from 
sept mon 3rd till Thur sept 6th . 
The name of hotel is 
"Hamina Bastion apartments" , 
address : 
Pikkuympyrakatu 10, 49400 hamina , Finland. 
They have free cancelation before sept 1st-
Just in case if something will go wrong w the embassy . As they suggest not to buy flight tickets just to have 
rsvp . 

PS my Rus. Passport pic is attached 

Thank you s0000 much !! 
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