From: Lesley Groff <] -
To: Larry Visoski Larry *’-"
Subject: Re: CAROSA - Transaction Receipt for $216.00
Date: Mon, 30 Jul 2018 14:13:14 +0000

wow! [ was talking with lke about you and how you ‘managed’ your timing when it comes to JE schedule...so
hard to fly all night (even with the biz seat) then go on to flying JE! ...and then to come back to a car service
issue. I get what Bella 1s trying to do...she does it to all of us...which 1s her job to save money. But when it
comes to Jeffrey he wants what he wants! I'm glad you let me know cause it is a good reminder for me as
well.. . I too have fallen victim to Bella’s demands!

[ am back and in NY at Je’s house. . .trying to catch up on all I missed! Had an amazing vacation. . Aspen was
truly unreal.. hiking and biking with our friends... great dinners...fun fun!

On Jul 30, 2018, at 9:50 AM, Larry Visoski <||| | | IR v rote:

So true

Bella has been on my case about the waiting charge from some car services, sometimes it’s out of my control, |
fell victim to Bella pushing me to save money and trying to tell me how to run the flight department, I learned
my lesson.,

I was up for 36 hours, and wasn’t in the mood for a delayed Car service for JEE,

I Airlined from New York to Pans Saturday night, flew all night on the airlines arrived at 8 AM in Paris Sunday
morning then we departed Paris at noon Sunday and flew back to New York with JEE on the G550.

Great flight, at least | was in business class and was able to sleep on the way to Paris, but still it was a rough
two days for me all 15 good now,

Are you back now?

Take Care
LarryV

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 30, 2018, at 9:44 AM, Lesley Gmff‘&- wrote:

ugh. ..

that stinks.

Agree we must book car service to arrive a bit earlier and pay for the wait time. Jeffrey would way rather pay
a few bucks than have to wait.

On Jul 29, 2018, at 1:29 PM, Larry Visoski <||| | | R  rote:

Hello Teresa and Gabe,

the driver was late today and | arrived 15min early, and my boss had to wait outside 10 minutes, of course,
he looks at me, like it’s my fault, with the evil eye .,

because the Front guard gate wouldn’t let the driver through expeditiously,.

[ tried to cut the arrival time short so the invoice wouldn’t have extra charges,

my error,, my fault!

It Will not happen again,
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, T will be less conservative on arrival time so the driver 15 certainly to be in place when 1t 1s my boss

Thx
Larry

Sent from my 1Phone

On Jul 29, 2018, at 12:40 AM, CARosa Limo ﬂi_'-'-* wrote:

Hi Larry,
I am confirming a VIP SUV for 1:45pm (@ Jet Aviation TEB, July 29th.

Thank You,
(Gabriel Roque

On Jul 28, 2018, at 11:48 PM, Larry Visoski &—'-* wrote:

Hello Teresa &
(rabe

B in Paris now,

We arnive USCustoms building Jet Avaition at Teterboro at 1:45pm sunday July 29th

I need a VIP Sedan or SUV for Mr Epstein pls
Drop him off at:

Can you confirm?

Thx
Larry Visoski
N212JE

Sent from my iPhone

On Apr 2. 2018, at 4:46 PM, CARosa Limo <|| | |G - ot

Hello Larry,

Hope all is good with you. Hope you are in Florida with this beautiful weather.
NI/NY weather is a joke. Snow is April LOL. Thank God Im not there.

I have enclosed the receipt for Thurs 3/29.

Best regards,
Teresa Goodyear

CARosa Limo LLC.
(Teterboro Airport)
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Phone: 201-747-7434 (Chris/Gabe)
24hrs/7days

—————- Forwarded message ————-——-
From: <

Date: Mon, Apr 2, 2018 at 4:39 PM
Subject: CAROSA - Transaction Receipt for $216.00

CARopsa Limo

Based @ Signature Flight Support TEB

Term ID: 001
Sale - Approved

Date: 04/02/18 Time: 16:39:49
Card Type: American Express Time Zone: EDT
Entry Method: Manual

Card #: XOOOOO0MXX1013

Invoice #: 001082
Approval Code: 123340

Customer Ret. |

Item Qty Amount Total Amount

Base Amount $£180.00

Tip $36.00
Amount $216.00

| agree to pay the above total amount according to the card
issuer agreement. (Merchant agreement if credit voucher)
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Map of purchase location

Customer Copy
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