
From: Lesley Groff 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 

Date: Mon, 10 Sep 2018 19:51:25 +0000 

If you believe she will really go another time I can pay 70 Euros to change her trip...or we take the loss now. I 
can rebook for dates in November...please advise if I should Re Book for November some time. thanks 
(below from Natasha at Amex) 

It is non-refundable ticket. If we cancel, full loss - $794.38. If we re-book different dates - change fee EUR 70.00 plus 
possible difference in fare. Let me know what to do. 

On Sep 10, 2018, at 12:55 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

tell her , it was for an interview only, but as our schedule changed due to weather , we will have to 
rescheulde for abnother time and lesely cancel the ticket 

On Mon, Sep 10, 2018 at 6:38 PM, > wrote: 
is asking about where is she going to stay, what are the dates, and how much is she going to get paid 

for the trip?? A bit strange 
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