
Front: Bella Klein aa. 
To: 

Subject: Re: Reimbursements 
Date: Tue, 25 Sep 2018 16:26:56 +0000 

Attachments: Scan_454.pdf; Scan_453.pdf; Scan_451.pdf; 
Scan_452.pdf; Scan_450.pdf; Scan_449.pdf; Scan_448.pdf 

OK, but please resend your pdf - print landscape to print. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

> On Sep 25, 2018, at 12:13 PM, > wrote: 

> HI Bella...can you please give my reimbursement money to Rich as he is coming here today at 
3pm to see Jeffrey. Total : $312.25 (disregard the scan of Jeffrey's medicare form)! 
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