From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: Lesley Groff ~"~_-“->
Subject: Re: Jack Goldberger
Date: Mon, 01 Oct 2018 20:18:21 +0000

ok
we will send today
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

On Oct 1, 2018, at 3:52 PM, Lesley Gru;ﬂ"*-‘_‘-* wrote:

wire to Jack's office please!

On Oct 1, 2018, at 3:40 PM, Richard Kahn ~"~'_'-'-* wrote:

jee will say ves
please ask jack if he wants wire or check and if to him personally or business
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBERK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On Oct 1, 2018, at 3:35 PM. Lesley Grul"l"*-‘_‘-* wrote:

Below from Jack Goldberger. ..OK for Rich to reimburse Jack?

EFTA00483087



hi Lesley,
We had a wonderful weekend in NY. Would you let Rich know my hotel bill for the weekend was 51340,

| also had a $350 airplane change fee for last month when | had to change flights on a trip we had scheduled
because we had a court hearing that Jeffrey wanted me to be at.
Thanks
jack
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