
From: Bella Klein 
To: Lesley Groff'

Subject: Re: Amex 
Date: Tue, 16 Oct 2018 17:31:24 +0000 

check deposited 
Thank you, 

Bella 

> On Oct 16, 2018, at 10:25 AM, Lesley Groff 
< > 

wrote: 

> check written to JEFFREY EPSTEIN and on my desk for Rich to bring to you today 

>> On Oct 12, 2018, at 2:10 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

>> 

>> Hi Les, 

>> 

>> Amex charge of $ 267.96 on 9/17 Jet Blue for your husband. Please prepare a check to JE 

and mail it or give to Rich when you will see next time 

>> 

>> Thank you, 

>> Bella 

>> 

>> 

>> 

>> 

>> 
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