
From: Bella Klein 
To: ==l > 

Subject: Re: Reimbursements (I hope!) 
Date: Mon, 12 Nov 2018 17:26:15 +0000 

Attachments: 

it is very good, but wrong attachment 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 212-971-1307 

> On Nov 12, 2018, at 12:23 PM, > wrote: 

> • This should work_but let me know... 
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