
From: Lesley Groff <MIMIII > 
To: 

Subject: Re: I can not book ME Melia for you! 
Date: Fri, 04 Jan 2019 00:27:02 +0000 

OK...looking to book you the Intercontinental London Park Lane ...the reservation dept is closed 
so we must wait for them to open in order to get the 3rd party CC form. Some hotels require 
48 hour for 3rd party forms...hoping this one does not (the ME Melia required 48 hours prior 
notice.... bummer) 

> On Jan 3, 2019, at 7:14 PM, wrote: 

> • Thank you for your help Lesley , let me know tomorrow. 

> • Envoye de mon iPhone 

>> Le 4 janv. 2019 A 00:59, a ecrit : 
>> 
>> I am trying_but I will need to fill out a 3rd party credit card form and offices are 
closed_I may have to do this tomorrow. 
>> 
>>> On Jan 3, 2019, at 6:36 PM, > wrote: 
>>> 
>>> Maybe another hotel 
>>> 
>>> Envoye de mon iPhone 
>>> 
>>>> Le 4 janv. 2019 A 00:10, •c > a ecrit : 
>>» 
>>» I can not book this hotel for you...you must show the credit card you pay with at 
the front desk. you will not have Jeffrey's credit card with you. Can you pay for the hotel 
and have Bella wire you the money? 
>>» 
>>>>> On Jan 3, 2019, at 2:24 PM, wrote: 
>>>» 
>>>>> Thank you , we had a lot of fun. Train departure from Paris 14h43 on Friday and return 
14h22 departure from London on Sunday back to Paris . For the hotel me melia in Westminster 
(there is a possibility to pay the hotel straight on their website ) . Thank you Lesley 
>>>» 
>>>>> Envoye de mon iPhone 
>>>» 
>>>>>> Le 3 janv. 2019 A 20:03, ‹ > a ecrit : 
>>>>» 
>>>>>> Hello and a healthy and happy new year to you! Hope you had 
fun in Dubai. 
>>>>» 
>>>>>> Please advise the train time for tomorrow (Friday Jan. 4th) as well as for Sunday Jan. 
6...was there a particular hotel you would like to stay in? or an area you need to be in? 
>>>>» 
>>>>>>> On Jan 3, 2019, at 1:33 PM, wrote: 
>>>>>» 
>>>>>>> Good evening Lesley , wish You an happy new year 2019 full of joy happiness and 
blessings . Can you please organize for me train ticket to go to London tomorrow and back 
Sunday ? Also if you can organize a hotel for me ? Thank you Lesley 
>>>>>» 
>>>>>>> Envoye de mon iPhone 
>>>>» 
>>» 
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