
From: 
To: 

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 
Date: Fri, 01 Mar 2019 17:27:51 +0000 

yes please...we need it...if they sent you a link for payment, can you forward ... 

On Mar 1, 2019, at 12:26 PM, . < wrote: 

Yes, I'm registered there, and payment is in that account. Should I give you my log in information? 

• 
On Fri, 1 Mar 2019 at 18:46, 

Ok, and you are registered? we simply need to pay? 
wrote: 

On Mar I, 2019, at 11:40 AM, wrote: 

Hello =I. I would like to take these courses: 

Links is there : 

Thank you! 

• 
On Fri, I Mar 2019 at 14:16, wrote: 

Hello . Circling back. Can you please provide me with the details of your class(s) you would 
like to take? Is there a payment link or invoice you can forward? I need to give our accounting 
department the details so they can pay for you.! 

Thanks, 

Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein. 

Sent from my iPhone 

EFTA00491496


