
From: Bella Klein 
To: IMI > 

Cc: 
Subject: Re: Tokyo refund 

Date: Wed, 13 Mar 2019 13:10:27 +0000 

Hi 
Wire reimbursement for $2219.43 was sent 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

> On Mar 13, 2019, at 8:46 AM, wrote: 

> • Dear Bella, 

> • Thank you very much for the prompt response. 
> It is -$2,219.43 on my chase account. 

> • Thank you!!! 

>> On Mar 13, 2019, at 8:40 AM, Bella Klein < wrote: 
>> 
>> Hi 
>> Please email charges on your credit card in USD so I can reimburse, receipts are in 
Japanese currency 
>> 
>> Thank you, 
>> 
>> Bella 
>> 
>> 
>>> On Mar 13, 2019, at 2:50 AM, wrote: 
>>> 
>>> Dear Bella, 
>>> 
>>> How are you? 
>>> Please find attached photo of my receipt from Andaz Hyatt Tokyo. told me that you 
can process refund for me. 
>>> 
>>> Please let me know if there is anything else that I should provide. 
>>> 
>>> Kind regards, 
>>> 
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>>> Kind Regards, 
>>> 
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