
From: Lesley Groff  
To: Cara George  

Subject: Re: From Lesley Groff 
Date: Thu, 14 Mar 2019 13:31:44 +0000 

No worries! Thank you! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 14, 2019, at 8:53 AM, Cara George > wrote: 

Sony! I should have caught that. My mistake! I'm putting the quote together now. I'll send it to you with the 
payment authorization form shortly. 

Thanks, 
Cara George 
Office Manager 
All Ball ProTM 

On Wed, Mar 13, 2019 at 3:33 PM Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
Sony. Had that I. The first email 

Lesley Groff 
159 Oenoke Ridge 
New Canaan CT 06840 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 13, 2019, at 4:31 PM, Can George < > wrote: 

What address would we be shipping to so I can calculate the shipping cost? 

Cara George 
Office Manager 
All Ball ProTM 

On Tue, Mar 12, 2019 at 4:44 PM Lesley Groff < wrote: 
Hi Cara...Here is a picture of our wheel...I measured from the outside edge of the vinyl and it was 9Ft by 
6"10 (which is probably supposed to be 7Ft)...Can You give me a quote for 4 new wheels please? 
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