
From: Cindy C Steinbeck 

To: ' • <1 
Subject: FW: The Westin Palace, Milan Documents for eSignature 

Date: Sat, 06 Apr 2019 18:35:09 +0000 
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Hi Lesley, 

Here is the credit card authorization form. Let me know if you have any issues. 

CINDY STEINBECK l RELATIONSIIIP MANAGER 

AMERICAN EXPRESS TRAVEL & LIFESTYLE SERVICES 

OFFICE IIOURS MONDAY-FRIDAY 9:00AM-5:30PM ET 
EXT= E: 

ppd:image003.png@0lD3CFD8.EED 
DB870 

From: FLORIANA ALIOTTI 
Sent: Saturday, April 6, 2019 1:31 PM 
To: Cindy C Steinbeck 
Subject: The Westin Palace, Milan Documents for eSignature 

;logo 

FLORIANA ALIOTTI (The Westin Palace, Milan) has sent you the 
file "Credit Card Authorization Form" for your review and 
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signature. 

REVIEW & COMPLETE 

Please fully filled in. Regards 

Alternatively to review and sign you may copy and paste the following URL in your 
browser: 

If you have any questions related to documents or wish to contact FLORIANA 
ALIOTTI, please email at: 

Powered by Sertifi 
Learn how to close business faster using Sertifi. https://www.sertifi.com 

Make 
electronic 

350 N LaSalle St -300 Chicago.  IL 60654 

American Express made the following annotations 

"This message and any attachments are solely for the intended recipient and may contain confidential or 
privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, use, or distribution of the 
information 

included in this message and any attachments is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, 
please notify us by reply e-mail and immediately and permanently delete this message and any attachments. 
Thank you." 

American Express a ajoute le commentaire suivant le 

Ce courrier et toute piece jointe qu'il contient sont reserves au seul destinataire indique et peuvent renfermer des 
renseignements confidentiels et privilegies. Si vous n'etes pas le destinataire prevu, toute divulgation, 
duplication, utilisation ou distribution du courrier ou de toute piece jointe est interdite. Si vous avez recu cette 
communication par erreur, veuillez nous en aviser par courrier et detruire immediatement le courrier et les pieces 
jointes. Merci. 
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