
From: Lesley Groff

To: Dangene Enterprise call iMa> 

Subject: Re: Invoice 

Date: Tue, 21 Mar 2017 12:13:24 +0000 

Hi Angie! This is perfect!.. So I have it straight, this invoice represents 3 sessions... We have 46 of 52 sessions 
remaining...can you forward the invoice for the other 3 sessions we are deducting from Jeffrey's package? I need 
to keep all in a folder together...No rush...just need... 

Also, can you verify that the below charge is from Sam? Is she partners with Ousaima? I am thinking it is my 
visit to her on Feb. 7th? I need a copy of the invoice...i can call this d 

02/08/2017 
OUSAIMA AL MISKY MD PLLC 000000001 
- NEW YORK, NY 

On Mar 17, 2017, at 7:08 PM, Appointment <II IMa> wrote: 

EFTA00499363


