From: Lesley Groff <[ G-
To: Dangene Enterprise < -
Subject: Re: Invoice

Date: Tue, 21 Mar 2017 12:14:54 +0000

Hi Angie! This 1s perfect!.. So I have it straight, this invoice represents 3 sessions. .. We have 46 of 52 sessions
remaining._.can yvou forward the invoice for the other 3 sessions we are deducting from Jeffrey’s package? [ need
to keep all in a folder together. . .No rush.. just need...

thank y

On Mar 17, 2017, at 7:08 PM, Appointment ‘=~_" wrote:
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