
From: Karyna Shuliak 
To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 02 Sep 2014 16:56:17 +0000 

Thank you Rich! 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Sep 2, 2014, at 12:55 PM, Richard Kahn < Ila> wrote: 

> school invoice in the amount if 1742 has been paid today 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
> New York, NY 10022 
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