
From: Karyna Shuliak <  I"
To: Justine Amoroso < 

Subject: Re: Estimate from TOP HAT INC. 

Date: Thu, 24 Aug 2017 17:55:37 +0000 

Thank you Justine! All looks good now. 
I will send you the credit card form in a little while. 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

On Aug 24, 2017, at 1:49 PM, Justine Amoroso -1 I> wrote: 

Hi, 
Please see updated attached 

Thank you 
Justine 
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