From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: Karyna Shuliak ~_
Subject: Re:
Date: Tue, 15 Jan 2013 01:16:27 0000

Wire has been completed

Attached 1s venfication

Please confirm that funds have been received
Thank you

On 1/14/13 3:26 PM, "Karyna Shuliak" ~_» wrote:

EFTA00527793



