
From: 

To: arda beskardes 

Cc: mutlu orturk <mutlu@hukuk.pro> 

Subject: Re: Academic Evaluation 

Date: Sat, 07 Jan 2012 02:34:59 +0000 

Hi Arda, 
I will have our accountant send you a check for this. 
Best, 

On Jan 6, 2012, at 5:21 PM, arda beskardes <arda@hukuk.pro> wrote: 

They promised Monday. Also, we paid the evaluation fee out of pocket. It amounted to $600. This is more 
expensive than a simple degree evaluation. Should we send an invoice? If not necessary, you guys can simply 
mail me a check. 

Best, 

Arda 

M. Arda Beskardes 
Attorney-at-Law 
6 Maiden Lane, 6th Floor 
(alt. entry at 160 B'way) 
New York, New York 10038 
USA 

New Number!) 

www.hukuk.pro

Admitted to practice law in New York and Tennessee 

Warning: Unless you have a signed engagement 
letter with me, you should not consider information 
contained herein as legal advice and you should 
check with your own counsel before relying on this message. 

On Tue, Jan 3, 2012 at 4:59 PM, arda beskardes <-arda@hukuk.pro> wrote: 
they said a few more days-- the professors who do the 

evaluations are now returning from their holidays. 

Arda 

On 1/3/12, wrote: 
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> Hi Arda 

> Just checking whether you have any response regarding my academic 
> evaluation yet? 

> Thank you 

Sent from my mobile device 

M. Arda Beskardes 
Attorney-at-Law 
6 Maiden Lane, 6th Floor 
(alt. entry at 160 B'way) 
New York, New York 10038 
USA 

(New Number!) 

www.hukuk.pro

Admitted to practice law in New York and Tennessee 

Warning: Unless you have a signed engagement 
letter with me, you should not consider information 
contained herein as legal advice and you should 
check with your own counsel before relying on this message. 
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