
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Karyna Shuli 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Mon, 14 Jan 2013 15:09:09 +0000 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Jan 14, 2013, at 10:08 AM, Karyna Shuliak wrote: 

I am awaiting for the details, will let you know as I get it. 
Thank you. 
On Jan 14, 2013, at 9:59 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

can you please forward me the wiring instructions 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Jan 14, 2013, at 8:51 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

pleae wire 15k dollars , to karyna mother. 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
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