
From: Richard Kahn <MM IIIMME> 

To: Karyna Shuliak <MI IMMM> 

Subject: Re: Artefacto 

Date: Thu, 04 Jun 2015 17:50:44 +0000 

yes are you free to speak so i can explain 
we will have a credit for 3-4k for goods not received on last shipment 
i plan to write email to artefacto either today or tomorrow detailing this which i will copy you on 

please let me know what you decide on rug? 
in addition shall we put on jee plane for next visit to PHI to saving approx 800-1000 in shipping costs? 

please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fa 
cel 

> On Jun 4, 2015, at 1:46 PM, Karyna Shuliak <E > wrote: 

> Hi Rich, 
> Jeffrey was saying we have credit left with Artefacto, however they say we don't anymore. Wanted to check 
with you? 
> Thanks, 
> Karyna. 

EFTA00530293


