
From: bellaklein  
To: Karyna Shuliak  
Cc:  >, Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Amex 
Date: Thu, 30 Apr 2015 16:27:49 +0000 

Ok, has about $700 to spend. M, please let me know if it is enough to cover car rental. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Apr 30, 2015, at 12:21 PM, Karyna Shuliak < wrote: 

Hi Bella, 
FYI: JE told me today to extend the car rental for this weekend, so will need to pay more with her card. 
Thank you, 
Karyna. 

On Apr 30, 2015, at 10:33 AM, bellaklein < > wrote: 

Hi M, 
Yesterday i increased your limit $500 for car rental as per JE request. As you can see from below other 
charges were made that exceeded your limit of $3500 by $329.71. That was the reason that Hertz charge was 
declined. Please explain charges other than Hertz. I need to lower your limit back to $3000 unless you will 
receive JE approval for a higher limit. You can start using your card after May 10th. 

APR 29 
EQUINOX•63RD 

APR 29 
HERTZ RAC FIREFLY 

APR 29 
WALGREENS 

APR 30 
ONLINE PAYMENT PROCESSED BY STRIPE.COM 

APR 30 
ONLINE PAYMENT PROCESSED BY STRIPE.COM 

Thank you, 

5 Items 

Total Pending Charges $72271 

EFTA00530629



Bella 

Tel: 

EFTA00530630


