
From: Angela Jordan 
To: Karyna Shuliak 

Subject: RE: Reserve 4 137037 

Date: Fri, 03 Jun 2016 19:25:12 +0000 

Hello Karyna, 

OK. Thank you. 

--Angela 

Angela Jordan 

Christopher Hyland, Inc. 

979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 

New York, NY 10022 

Tel (212) 688-6121 

Fax (212) 688-6176 

From: Karyna Shuliak [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, June 03, 2016 12:06 PM 
To: Angela Jordan 
Cc: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: Re: Reserve # 137037 

Hello Angela, 

Please find attached the resale certificate. Our manager, Mr. Kahn, will review the invoice and provide the 
payment information. 

Thank you, 
Karyna. 

On Jun 2, 2016, at 5:39 PM, Angela Jordan wrote: 

Hello Kayrna, 

As discussed, attached is reserve # 137037. I have also included our resale certificate and our credit card form (if you 
wish to pay with credit card). Please note I have included NYS sales tax on your reserve which is remove once I received 
completed resale certificate. 

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me. 

Thank you so much. 

--Angela 

Angela Jordan 

EFTA00533510



Christopher Hyland, Inc. 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 
Tel 
Fax (212) 688-6176 

<Resale Certificate.PDF><Mail Attachment><Reserve # 137037.pdf> 
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