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Ok, should brown furniture be included? All of them or only a good one?
What about these round tables? 4 of them have rust and damages?
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On Jun 6, 2016, at 1:01 PM, Karyna Shuliak _“ wrote:

Thanks Daphne,
Please coordinate with Rich Kahn regarding the financial part. Janusz, regarding the broken furniture, please do not

make the covers for it, as we might replace it with a different kind. Please make sure it is not included in the quote.
Thanks,

Karyna.

On Jun 6, 2016, at 10:56 AM, Daphne Wallace <[ N v ot<:

Greetings Karyna,

Attached please find the quote from Mr. Santos of Casa Vera for fabric and labor for the 63 covers for the PB outdoor
furniture.

I emailed Mr. Santos for an estimated timeline for the project, so can have an idea of how long it will take if you
decide to proceed.

Kind regards, Daphne

From: <] -
Date: Mon, Jun 6, 2016 at 8:20 AM

Subject: Estimate 1581 from Casa Vera Window Treatment, Inc
To: —
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Dear Customer:

Please review the attached estimate- 1581, Feel free to contact us if vou have any questions.
We look forward to working with vou.

Sincerely,
Casa Vera Window Treatment,Inc

3052994449
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