From: Daphne Wallace <[ | NG
To: Karyna Shuliak <[ | -

Ce: Karyna Shuliak < =, Janusz Banasiak < =~ R
. =, Renato PB < e

Subject: Re: Estimate 1581 from Casa Vera Window Treatment.Inc

Date: Thu, 09 Jun 2016 16:44:17 +0000

Greetings Karyna,

If 1t 15 your preference, I will certainly ask Mr. Santos if he can schedule a site visit to collect measurements
rather than taking out the furniture.

Kind regards, Daphne

On Thu, Jun 9, 2016 at 11:42 AM, Karyna Shuliak {—-“-* wrote:
Hi Daphne,
Does this mean that Janusz need to put a chair and a table and bring it to them? Could they maybe come to the
house and do the fitting?

On Jun 9, 2016, at 10:17 AM, Daphne Wallace <[ GG ot
Greetings Karyna,

Mr. Santos has requested to borrow one piece of 3 of the various sized chairs and one of the small tables to
ensure the cover fitting 15 correct.

Can you obtain permission for this, and I will coordinate with Janusz and Mr. Santos 15 permission is granted.
Kind regards, Daphne

—————————— Forwarded message —---——--

From: Lourisvaldo Santos ﬂi_*

Date: Wed, Jun 8, 2016 at 5:48 PM
Subject: Re: Estimate 1581 from Casa Vera Window Treatment,Inc

To: Daphne Wallace <||

Hi Mrs.Daphne, how are you?
That's great , thank you!!
You can send check or wire

To make a better work 1 like to ask you if we can have one chair P.1 - one big chair P.5 - Small table P.3 - and
one lounge chair P.7 |

Kind regards,
Lory

On Wed, Jun 8, 2016 at 10:33 AM, Daphne Wallace f'~'_* wrote:

Greetings Mr. Santos,

EFTA00533703



Your quote has been approved. Please let me know your preferred method of payment - check, wire or
credit card, and when you can schedule to begin the project.

Kind regards, Daphne

On Tue, Jun 7, 2016 at 9:35 PM, *’_J* wrote:

Dear Customer:

Please review the attached estimate- 1581. Feel free to contact us 1f you have any questions.
We look forward to working with you.

Sincerely,
Casa Vera Window Treatment,Inc

3052994449

EFTA00533704



