
From: Lina Varela  
To: 

Subject:artefacto 
Date: Tue, 24 May 2016 15:50:51 +0000 

Attachments: ICARYNA_1.pdf; Credit_Card_Authorizationl.doc; TERMS_&_CONDITIONS.pdf 

Hello Karyna, 

I hope everything is well. 

Please find attached the Order and Credit card Authorization for the Cuba Mirror in Silver. 

Let me know if you have any more questions. 

Thank you. 

Lina Varela 
Interior Design Consultant 

Artefac to 

From: Una Varela [manta 
Sent: Sunday, May 15, 2016 12:54 PM 
To:  
Subject: art efacto 

Hello Karyna, 

The prices of the mirror that I have in stock. 

D&6 Mirror is $3,291.99 

Delphos Mirror is $2,347.51 

Grant Mirror is $3,843.94 

Let me know if you have any questions. 

Thank you, 

EFTA00534092



Lina Varela 
Interior Design Consultant 

Artefac to 

EFTA00534093


