
From: Richard Kahn

To: Karyna Shuliak 

Cc: bellaklein 

Subject: Fwd: arte facto 

Date: Tue, 24 May 2016 17:40:11 +0000 

Attachments: ICARYNA_Lpdf; Credit_Card_Authorizationl.doc; TERMS_&_CONDITIONS.pdf 

i reviewed attached and have the following questions: 

a) was this previously purchased - i reviewed invoices for PBI and could not find it - if yes what was price 
b) discount should be 20% not 10% as that is what we received on all previous orders 
c) invoice should be made out to JSC Interiors LLC not Karyna 

please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Fwd: a rtef acto 
Date: May 24, 2016 at 12:38:47 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Lina Varela 

Hello Rich, 
Please see below the invoice and credit card authorization form for the mirror from Artefacto for Palm Beach. 
Could you please fill it out for Lina to proceed with the payment.. 
Thank you! 
Karyna. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Lina Varela
Date: May 24, 2016 at 11:50:51 AM AST 
To: 

EFTA00534094



Subject:artefacto 

Hello Karyna, 

I hope everything is well. 

Please find attached the Order and Credit card Authorization for the Cuba Mirror in Silver. 

Let me know if you have any more questions. 

Thank you. 

Lina Varela 
Interior Design Consultant 

Artefac to 

From: Lina Varela [mailto 
Sent: Sunday, May 15, 2016 12:54 PM 
To: 
Subject:artefacto 

Hello Karyna, 

The prices of the mirror that I have in stock. 

D&6 Mirror is $3,291.99 

Delphos Mirror is $2,347.51 

Grant Mirror is $3,843.94 

Let me know if you have any questions. 

Thank you, 

Lina Varela 
Interior Design Consultant 

Artefac to 

EFTA00534095



EFTA00534096


