
From: Lina Varela 
To: 11Catyna Shuliak' 

Subject: RE: SLK designs invoice 
Date: Wed, 25 May 2016 17:37:25 +0000 

Attachments: JSC_INTERIORS_LLC.pdf; Credit_Card_Authorizationl.doc; 
TERMS_&_CONDITIONS.pdf 

Hello Karyna, 

Please find attached the Order with discount applied and under the name of 
the new Company. 

Please fill it out, and I will proceed the payment. 

Let me know if you have any questions. 

Thank you, 

Lina Varela 
Interior Design Consultant 

 Original Message 
From: Karyna Shuliak [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, May 24, 2016 5:37 PM 
To: Lina Varela 
Subject: SLK designs invoice 

Hi Lina, 
As per our conversation, please see the invoice attached with one of our 
previous orders.. 
Thank you, 
Karyna. 

EFTA00534098


